

Bill To:
 Lake Township (Roscommon County)
 1380 Michelson Road
 Houghton Lake MI 48629

Time Entries	Rate	Hours	Sub
9/2/2025 Telephone conference with counsel for property owners and Supervisor regarding potential STR regulations	\$250.00	.6	\$150.00
9/3/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor, draft legal opinion, and correspondence with Board regarding STR regulatory options	\$250.00	2.3	\$575.00
9/5/2025 Telephone conference with client regarding PC removal, draft agenda for public hearing regarding the same	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00
9/8/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor; telephone conference with counsel for property owners regarding potential STR regulations	\$250.00	.4	\$100.00
9/8/2025 Draft agenda for public hearing regarding removal of PC member, correspondence with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	.6	\$150.00
9/8/2025 Review materials regarding parks and recreation committee, correspondence regarding the same	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00
9/9/2025 Review materials regarding Parks and Recreation Committee, correspondence and telephone conference with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	.8	\$200.00
9/9/2025 Prepare for public hearing regarding removal of PC member	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00
9/9/2025 Review correspondences re: Planning Commission issue	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
9/10/2025 Draft: email to twp. re updates	\$150.00	.1	\$15.00
9/10/2025 Telephone conference w/ co-counsel regarding supervisor questions.	\$230.00	.2	\$46.00
9/10/2025 Legal research re: cameras in polling location.	\$230.00	.6	\$138.00
9/10/2025 Prepare for public hearing on PC removal, correspondence to Board, telephone conference with Trustee and Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	2.0	\$500.00

Time Entries	Rate	Hours	Sub
9/10/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor and legal research regarding FOIA, Zoning, STRs, conflicts of interest, and other board matters	\$250.00	1.5	\$375.00
9/11/2025 Prepare for and attend public hearing on removal of PC member	\$250.00	10.2	\$2,550.00
9/11/2025 Telephone call w/ co-counsel; research re resolution for final decision	\$250.00	.7	\$175.00
9/12/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding FOIA matters	\$250.00	.2	\$50.00
Telephone conference with Supervisor, correspondence with Clerk, and review materials regarding FOIA requests and meeting minutes	\$250.00	.8	\$200.00
9/17/2025 Legal research re: Michigan Election Law and Cameras in polling location	\$230.00	1.0	\$230.00
9/17/2025 Draft proposed correspondence to client	\$230.00	.4	\$92.00
9/18/2025 Legal research re: OMA SOL, potential litigation re full disclosure of records	\$150.00	4.1	\$615.00
9/18/2025 Draft: Corr to sup and clerk re proposed disclosures	\$150.00	.5	\$75.00
9/18/2025 Review/revise correspondence to client.	\$230.00	.7	\$161.00
9/18/2025 Draft legal opinion regarding conflict of interest.	\$230.00	2.5	\$575.00
9/18/2025 Review and revise legal opinion regarding election law matters, correspondence with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	.8	\$200.00
9/19/2025 Review and revise legal opinion regarding conflicts of interest, telephone conference with co-counsel and correspondence with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	1.1	\$275.00
9/19/2025 Review/revise: OMA SOL Corr per TJC	\$150.00	.7	\$105.00
9/19/2025 Review/revise legal opinion on conflicts of interest.	\$230.00	1.2	\$276.00
9/19/2025 Review/revise legal analysis re: FOIA records, OMA, and public perception; revise/review responsive records; correspondence with client and co-counsel re: same.	\$190.00	1.5	\$285.00
9/24/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding ordinance amendments, Board meeting matters, and FOIA requests	\$250.00	.9	\$225.00
9/25/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding election law questions, FOIA, and conflicts of interest; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same	\$250.00	.6	\$150.00

Time Entries	Rate	Hours	Sub
Legal research and correspondence with co-counsel regarding possession of township records and policy regarding the same	\$250.00	.6	\$150.00
9/30/2025 Legal research re: storage of Township records.	\$190.00	.5	\$95.00
			\$8,980.50

August / September Bills:

From July through September the Township Supervisor initiated and drove a taxpayer-funded campaign directed at a respected, long-serving Planning Commission member, resulting in nearly \$11,000 in taxpayer funded legal fees. He repeatedly engaged the township attorney without a board directive, raising serious concerns about the justification for this use of taxpayer money. **Why?**