

Bill To:
 Lake Township (Roscommon County)
 1380 Michelson Road
 Houghton Lake MI 48629

Time Entries	Rate	Hours	Sub
8/1/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding zoning matters and encumbrances on township property	\$250.00	1.3	\$325.00
8/4/2025 Legal research, correspondence, and telephone conference with Supervisor regarding zoning matters	\$250.00	.7	\$175.00
8/5/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding STR enforcement and regulation	\$250.00	.5	\$125.00
8/5/2025 Review and revise legal opinion regarding Planning Commission matters	\$250.00	.5	\$125.00
8/5/2025 Draft legal opinion re: Planning commission issue	\$225.00	4.4	\$990.00
8/6/2025 Draft legal opinion re: Planning Commission Issue	\$225.00	.5	\$112.50
8/7/2025 Correspondences re: Planning Commission issue	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
8/8/2025 Phone call w/ co-counsel re: Planning Commission issue	\$225.00	.2	\$45.00
8/8/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor and co-counsel regarding PC matter	\$250.00	.6	\$150.00
8/11/2025 Draft legal opinion re: Planning Commission issue	\$225.00	3.2	\$720.00
8/11/2025 Review and revise legal opinion regarding PC matters, correspondence with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	1.9	\$475.00
8/12/2025 Review correspondence from Supervisor regarding PC matters	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00
8/13/2025 Phone call w/ co-counsel re: planning commission issue	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
8/13/2025 Draft written charges for removal of PC member, telephone conference with client regarding the same	\$250.00	3.7	\$925.00

Time Entries	Rate	Hours	Sub
8/14/2025 Draft written charges for removal of PC member	\$250.00	1.2	\$300.00
8/14/2025 Review and correspondences w/ co-counsel re: Planning Commission	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
8/15/2025 Draft written charges for removal of PC member, telephone conference with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	1.0	\$250.00
8/18/2025 Legal research and telephone conference with Supervisor regarding notice for public hearing to remove PC member	\$250.00	.5	\$125.00
8/18/2025 Legal research re: Hearing requirements	\$225.00	1.1	\$247.50
8/19/2025 Review re: Planning commission issue	\$225.00	.3	\$67.50
8/19/2025 Telephone conference with Clerk and Supervisor regarding public hearing notice, draft the same; draft written charges for potential removal of Planning Commission member	\$250.00	1.2	\$300.00
8/21/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor and review and revise written charges for potential removal of PC member	\$250.00	1.3	\$325.00
8/21/2025 Review FOIA request, telephone conference with Supervisor and correspondence to Clerk regarding the same	\$250.00	.5	\$125.00
8/22/2025 Telephone conference w/ co-counsel re: FOIA request; legal research re: same; review relevant emails	\$190.00	.4	\$76.00
8/22/2025 Review re: Planning Commission issue	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
8/22/2025 Legal research, review materials, telephone conference and correspondence with Supervisor and Clerk regarding FOIA request	\$250.00	1.0	\$250.00
8/22/2025 Review and revise written charges regarding removal of PC member, correspondence and telephone conference with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	.9	\$225.00
8/25/2025 Correspondence and telephone conference with Clerk and Supervisor regarding FOIA requests	\$250.00	1.3	\$325.00
8/25/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding FOIA, audit, and Township Hall matters	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00
8/25/2025 Telephone conference with client and review and revise written charges regarding removal of PC member	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00
8/25/2025 Telephone counsel with JNW.	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00

Time Entries	Rate	Hours	Sub
8/26/2025 Telephone conference w/ co-counsel re: FOIA request; review emails and documents re: same.	\$190.00	.4	\$76.00
8/26/2025 Correspondence with Supervisor and PC member regarding list of written charges, telephone conference with Supervisor regarding the same	\$250.00	.4	\$100.00
8/26/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding FOIA matters	\$250.00	.4	\$100.00
8/26/2025 Review correspondences re: Planning commission issue	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
8/27/2025 Correspondence with Supervisor and Clerk regarding FOIA appeal; telephone conference with Supervisor regarding FOIA appeal, board matters and public meetings, and STRs	\$250.00	2.3	\$575.00
8/28/2025 Receipt correspondences re: Planning Commission issue	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
8/28/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding FOIA matters	\$250.00	.4	\$100.00
8/28/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor, correspondence with PC member, and correspondence with Board regarding removal hearing and complaints	\$250.00	1.1	\$275.00
8/28/2025 Correspondence w/ client and co-counsel; re: FOIA request, applicable timeline, and response.	\$190.00	.7	\$133.00
8/28/2025 Draft 10 day extension letter re Aug 21, 2025, email FOIA request	\$150.00	.5	\$75.00
8/28/2025 Correspondence w/ TLC, in office meeting re FOIA generally; assigned to draft FOIA extension letter	\$150.00	.5	\$75.00
8/29/2025 Correspondence and telephone conference with Supervisor regarding PC member removal	\$250.00	.5	\$125.00
8/29/2025 Review FOIA materials, correspondence with Clerk and telephone conference with Supervisor regarding FOIA matters	\$250.00	1.0	\$250.00
8/29/2025 Review re: Legal opinion request	\$225.00	.1	\$22.50
8/29/2025 Telephone conference with Supervisor regarding zoning, enforcement and STR matters	\$250.00	.3	\$75.00
			\$9200.00

See comments on September bill.